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Further to your information request FOI/EIR 25/26-242, please find your question and our 
response below. 
 

Request:  
1. For the start of each financial year between 2015/16 and 2025/26 (inclusive), the number of 
council-funded youth clubs/centres . 
2. For the start of each financial year between 2015/16 and 2025/26 (inclusive), the number of 
youth clubs/centres run by partner organisations. 
3. For each financial year between 2015/16 and 2025/26 (inclusive), the annual budget for 
council-funded youth clubs/centres. 
4. For each financial year between 2015/16 and 2025/26 (inclusive), the annual council budget 
for youth services. 
5. For each financial year between 2015/16 and 2025/26 (inclusive), the number of Full-Time 
Equivalent staff employed at council-funded youth clubs/centres. 
 

Response:  
1. East Cambridgeshire District Council do not fund youth clubs/centres.  Grants are available. 
2. We do not hold historical information about youth clubs/centres run by partner organisations, 
for current youth clubs/centres, please see: 
https://eastcambs.gov.uk/community-safety-and-wellbeing/youth-zone/youth-clubs-and-groups  
3. n/a 
4. Grant funding for Youth Services falls into the budget as a whole for Communities & 
Partnerships.  We do not hold this as a separate figure. 
5. Zero 
 
 

 
This concludes your request FOI/EIR 25/26-242. 
 
If information has been refused, please treat this as a Refusal Notice for the purposes of the Act.  
 
If you disagree with our decision or are otherwise unhappy with how we have dealt with your 
request in the first instance you may approach foi@eastcambs.gov.uk and request a review. A 
request for review must be made in no more than 40 working days from the date of this email. 
 
Should you remain dissatisfied with the outcome you have a right under s50 of the Freedom of 
Information Act to appeal against the decision by contacting the Information Commissioner, 
Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow SK9 5AF. 
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