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Further to your information request FOI/EIR 25/26-023, please find your question and our 
response below. 
 

Request:  
I am writing to request information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. Please could 
you provide the following: 
 
1. The total number of homelessness applicants who approached the council to join the 
housing register, in 2022/23, 2023/24, and 2024/25. 
 
2. The total number of homelessness approaches involving the applicant fleeing domestic 
abuse, in 2022/23, 2023/24, and 2024/25. 
 
3. The number of homelessness applicants (for any reason) on the social housing register who 
were placed in each of your housing allocation bands (eg. Band A, Band B, Band C, etc), in 
2022/23, 2023/24, and 2024/25. Please also include the number who were not accepted onto 
the housing register. 
 
4. The number of homelessness applicants on the social housing register, who are fleeing 
domestic abuse, who were placed in each of your housing allocation bands (eg. Band A, Band 
B, Band C, etc), in 2022/23, 2023/24, and 2024/25. Please also include the number who were 
not accepted onto the housing register. 
 

Response:  
1. 

Year Number of Applicants Band A 

Homeless 

Number of Applicants Band B 

Homeless Prevention 

2022/23 54 83 

2023/24 67 91 

2024/25 53 107 

 
2. Please note: these figures also include applicants who are suffering ASB from neighbours 
etc as the banding is the same. 

Year Number of Applicants 

2022/23 35 

2023/24 10 

2024/25 5 

 
 
 
 
 



 

3.  We do not hold data on who wasn’t accepted 
Year Number of 

Applicants 

A 

Number of 

Applicants 

B 

Number of 

Applicants 

C 

2022/23 54 83 153 

2023/24 67 88 139 

2024/25 52 107 171 

 
4. We do not hold data on who wasn’t accepted 

Year Number of Applicants 

2022/23 13 

2023/24 10 

2024/25 31 

 
 
 
 

 
This concludes your request FOI/EIR 25/26-023. 
 
If information has been refused, please treat this as a Refusal Notice for the purposes of the Act.  
 
If you disagree with our decision or are otherwise unhappy with how we have dealt with your 
request in the first instance you may approach foi@eastcambs.gov.uk and request a review. A 
request for review must be made in no more than 40 working days from the date of this email. 
 
Should you remain dissatisfied with the outcome you have a right under s50 of the Freedom of 
Information Act to appeal against the decision by contacting the Information Commissioner, 
Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow SK9 5AF. 
 


